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Orders to remain in mouna 

 

 

 

 

 

I came here (Sri 
Ramanasramam) in May’03 
– purchased tickets for 
going back to Himalayas in 
July ’03. In June I get orders 
from Ramana (inner voice) – 
“You will take up a vow of 
silence for 1 year and in that 
period continue in 
Arunachala only.” I thought 
it could be my imagination. 
Next day a big business 
magnate and an ardent 
devotee of Ramana met me 
(we were only nodding 
acquaintances), not 
personally intimate. But 
suddenly he asked me:- 
Swamiji, why don’t you 
observe silence for one year 
and remain in Arunachala. I 
took this as a confirmation 
of inner voice. Otherwise I 
might have retorted, “Sir, 
why don’t you go on silence 
for a year.” 
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